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1. Khanh 
I believe the ICC is one of the most important organizations on campus. I love that it 
represents the whole student body and that it works with more than 50 clubs on campus. 
During my high school years and my first year at another college, I tried my best to join as 
many organizations as possible, since I love to be involved, make impacts, and meet new 
people. Because De Anza has so many cool and interesting clubs, I could not join all of them 
and give all my effort. That is why I believe it would be a great opportunity for me to be a 
part of the ICC. I agree that there is a first time for everything, and you don’t need the 
experience to be in a leadership position. However, for such an important position as the 
Chairperson, the applicants need to have at least some leadership experience in high school. It 
is true that I’m new to De Anza, and have no leadership experience here. Nevertheless, I was 
club president, vice president, and secretary, (including my position as club advisor for my 
high school’s student council) for multiple clubs in high school and UC Davis. 
 

2. Zahra 
Personally talking about this Topic. Since I'm new In United State, and I really like to join 
clubs even engage my self with people in the community, and learn more about the our 
environment, and learn about leadership skill. I really appreciate that if I could be a part of 
the ICC. My goals is to transfer to university as computer science-Transfer, so I can educate 
myself more in upper education. and share my experience with those who are looking for 
source of information to travel and study abroad, and moreover to share what I'm going 
through and understanding college in foreign country. Nowadays it's hard to travel and study 
without having any knowledge knowing about the fees and financial aid. Even though we 
have lots of information by searching online but mostly for those people that they don't know 
how to start. base on my situation meeting other people and talking in event or in our 
community could even help my level of my English language to improve myself. Lastly I 
could say that we all need to make risky decisions in our lives and make our community 
stronger, and be cable to give speech to our people and help them in this way. all theese could 
happen Just by supporting each other even if we are far away. 
 
 
 


